
BID DATE: APRIL 12, 2012
SUBJECT: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL
FOR: LEHIGH VALLEY COOPERATIVE PURCHASING COUNCIL
OWNER: COUNTY OF LEHIGH

Telford, PA Aston, PA Gainsville, GA Fort Wayne, IN

BID SECURITY BB $10,000.00 BB $10,000.00 BB $10,000.00 BB $10,000.00

GASOLINE TANKWAGON DELIVERIES:

PREMIUM GRADE: Less discount or plus premium $0.0000 $0.1890 $0.1839

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.2290 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) $0.2290 $0.1890 $0.1839 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.0019 $0.0019 $0.0019

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.0110 $0.0110 $0.0110

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.5060 $3.5060 $3.5060

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D+E) $3.7489 $3.7089 $3.7038

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Unbranded Various

Octane Rating 92 93 93

MEDIUM GRADE: Less discount or plus premium $0.0000 $0.1690 $0.1839

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.2090 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) $0.2090 $0.1690 $0.1839 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.0019 $0.0019 $0.0019

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.0110 $0.0110 $0.0110

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.3546 $3.3546 $3.3546

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D+E) $3.5775 $3.5375 $3.5524

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Unbranded Various

Octane Rating 89 89 89

REGULAR GRADE: Less discount or plus premium $0.0000 $0.1665 $0.1839

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.1990 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) $0.1990 $0.1665 $0.1839 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.0019 $0.0019 $0.0019

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.0110 $0.0110 $0.0110

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.2698 $3.2698 $3.2698

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D+E) $3.4827 $3.4502 $3.4676

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Unbranded Various

Octane Rating 87 87 87
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Farm & Home Isobunkers Mansfield Petroluem Traders

GASOLINE TRANSPORT DELIVERIES:

PREMIUM GRADE: Less discount or plus premium $0.0225 ($0.0078) $0.0192

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.0225 ($0.0078) $0.0192
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.0019 $0.0019 $0.0019

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.0110 $0.0110 $0.0110

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.5060 $3.5060 $3.5060

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D+E) $3.5424 $3.5121 $3.5391

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various Various

Octane Rating 93 93 93

MEDIUM GRADE: Less discount or plus premium $0.0225 ($0.0078) $0.0121

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.0225 ($0.0078) $0.0121
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.0019 $0.0019 $0.0019

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.0110 $0.0110 $0.0110

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.3546 $3.3546 $3.3546

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D+E) $3.3910 $3.3607 $3.3806

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various Various

Octane Rating 89 89 89

REGULAR GRADE: Less discount or plus premium $0.0094 ($0.0078) $0.0292

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.0094 ($0.0078) $0.0292
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.0019 $0.0019 $0.0019

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.0110 $0.0110 $0.0110

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.2698 $3.2698 $3.2698

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D+E) $3.2931 $3.2759 $3.3129

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various Various

Octane Rating 87 87 87

DIESEL TANKWAGON DELIVERIES:

Less discount or plus premium $0.0000 $0.1815 $0.1858

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.2250 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) $0.2250 $0.1815 $0.1858 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

$3.3835 $3.3888 $3.3888

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 (s/b $3.3841) (s/b $3.3841) (s/b $3.3841)

Add-on for dye for off road use (D) $0.0000 $0.0060 $0.0000
$3.6095 $3.5773 $3.5756

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) (s/b $3.6101) (s/b $3.5726) (s/b $3.5709)

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0300 $0.0900 $0.0750

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0300 $0.0350 $0.0250

ULTRA LOW 
SULFUR, OFF 
ROAD:
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Farm & Home Isobunkers Mansfield Petroluem Traders

B2, OFF ROAD: Less discount or plus premium $0.0000 $0.1765 $0.1858

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.2250 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) $0.2250 $0.1765 $0.1858 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.3970 $3.3971 $3.3971

Add-on for dye for off road use (D)

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $3.6230 $3.5746 $3.5839

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0300 $0.0900 $0.0750

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0300 $0.0350 $0.0250

B5, OFF ROAD: Less discount or plus premium $0.1840 $0.1857

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.1840 $0.1857 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.4044 $3.4044

Add-on for dye for off road use (D)

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $3.5894 $3.5911

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0900 $0.0750

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0350 $0.0250

B2, ON ROAD: Less discount or plus premium $0.0000 $0.1615 $0.1858

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.2350 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) $0.2350 $0.1615 $0.1858 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.3971 $3.3970 $3.3970

Add-on for dye for off road use (D)

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $3.6331 $3.5595 $3.5838

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0300 $0.0900 $0.0750

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0300 $0.0350 $0.0250

B5, ON ROAD: Less discount or plus premium $0.1740 $0.1857

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.1740 $0.1857 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.4002 $3.4002

Add-on for dye for off road use (D)

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $3.5752 $3.5869

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0900 $0.0750

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0350 $0.0250
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Farm & Home Isobunkers Mansfield Petroluem Traders

DIESEL TRANSPORT DELIVERIES:

Less discount or plus premium $0.0250 $0.0083

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.0250 $0.0083 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010

$3.3888 $3.3888

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 (s/b $3.3841) (s/b $3.3841)

Add-on for dye for off road use (D) $0.0060 $0.0000
$3.4208 $3.3981

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) (s/b $3.4161) (s/b $3.3934)

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0900 $0.0750

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0350 $0.0250

B2, OFF ROAD: Less discount or plus premium $0.0200 $0.0033

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.0200 $0.0033 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.3971 $3.3971

Add-on for dye for off road use (D)

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $3.4181 $3.4014

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0900 $0.0750

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0350 $0.0250

B5, OFF ROAD: Less discount or plus premium $0.0175 $0.0132

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.0175 $0.0132 No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.4044 $3.4044

Add-on for dye for off road use (D)

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $3.4229 $3.4186

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0900 $0.0750

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0350 $0.0250

B2, ON ROAD: Less discount or plus premium $0.0100 ($0.0017) ($0.0014)

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.0100 ($0.0017) ($0.0014)
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.3970 $3.3970 $3.3970

Add-on for dye for off road use (D)

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $3.4080 $3.3963 $3.3966

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0900 $0.0750 $0.1500

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0350 $0.0250 $0.0250

ULTRA LOW 
SULFUR, OFF 
ROAD:
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Farm & Home Isobunkers Mansfield Petroluem Traders

B5, ON ROAD: Less discount or plus premium $0.0175 ($0.0018) ($0.0098)

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid $0.0175 ($0.0018) ($0.0098)
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.0010 $0.0010 $0.0010

F.O.B. Terminal (C) a/o 04/02/2012 $3.4002 $3.4002 $3.4002

Add-on for dye for off road use (D)

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $3.4187 $3.3994 $3.3914

Brand Name Offered Unbranded Various Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.0900 $0.0750 $0.1500

Add-on for winterized blend $0.0350 $0.0250 $0.0250

No No No No

Yes / Yes / Yes Yes / No / No Yes / Yes / Yes Yes / Yes / Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes

No Bid replies were received from:

*  Lehigh Fuels, LLC - Allentown, PA

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT (Completed?)

CITY OF ALLENTOWN RESIDENT PREFERENCE 
FORM (Qualifies?)

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM FORM 
(Extend to Others?)
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